



	
	

	
	

	Page:Fraud Act 2006.pdf/5

	
		From Wikisource

		


		

		
		

		Jump to navigation
		Jump to search
		This page has been validated.

4

Fraud Act 2006 (c. 35)




(2) This section applies to a business which is carried on—


	(a) by a person who is outside the reach of section 458 of the Companies Act 1985 (c. 6) or Article 451 of the Companies (Northern Ireland) Order 1986 (S.I. 1986/1032) (N.I. 6)) (offence of fraudulent trading), and
	(b) with intent to defraud creditors of any person or for any other fraudulent purpose.


(3) The following are within the reach of section 458 of the 1985 Act—


	(a) a company (within the meaning of that Act);
	(b) a person to whom that section applies (with or without adaptations or modifications) as if the person were a company;
	(c) a person exempted from the application of that section.


(4) The following are within the reach of Article 451 of the 1986 Order—


	(a) a company (within the meaning of that Order);
	(b) a person to whom that Article applies (with or without adaptations or modifications) as if the person were a company;
	(c) a person exempted from the application of that Article.


(5) “Fraudulent purpose” has the same meaning as in section 458 of the 1985 Act or Article 451 of the 1986 Order.

(6) A person guilty of an offence under this section is liable—


	(a) on summary conviction, to imprisonment for a term not exceeding 12 months or to a fine not exceeding the statutory maximum (or to both);
	(b) on conviction on indictment, to imprisonment for a term not exceeding 10 years or to a fine (or to both).


(7) Subsection (6)(a) applies in relation to Northern Ireland as if the reference to 12 months were a reference to 6 months.

10 Participating in fraudulent business carried on by company etc.: penalty

(1) In Schedule 24 to the Companies Act 1985 (punishment of offences), in column 4 of the entry relating to section 458 of that Act, for “7 years” substitute “10 years”.

(2) In Schedule 23 to the Companies (Northern Ireland) Order 1986 (punishment of offences), in column 4 of the entry relating to Article 451 of that Order, for “7 years” substitute “10 years”.



Obtaining services dishonestly




11 Obtaining services dishonestly

(1) A person is guilty of an offence under this section if he obtains services for himself or another—


	(a) by a dishonest act, and
	(b) in breach of subsection (2).


(2) A person obtains services in breach of this subsection if—


	(a) they are made available on the basis that payment has been, is being or will be made for or in respect of them,










[image: ]

[image: ]

Retrieved from "https://en.wikisource.org/w/index.php?title=Page:Fraud_Act_2006.pdf/5&oldid=13632100"


		Category: 	Validated




	





	Navigation menu

	
		

	
		Personal tools
	

	
		
			Not logged in
	Talk
	Contributions
	Create account
	Log in


		
	



		
			

	
		Namespaces
	

	
		
			Previous page
	Next page
	Page
	Discussion
	Image
	Index


		
	



			

	
	
		English
	
	
		
		

		
	



		

		
			

	
		Views
	

	
		
			Read
	Edit
	View history


		
	



			

	
	
		More
	
	
		
		

		
	



			

	Search

	
		
			
			
			
			
		

	




		

	

	

	
		
	

	

	
		Navigation
	

	
		
			Main Page
	Community portal
	Central discussion
	Recent changes
	Subject index
	Authors
	Random work
	Random author
	Random transcription
	Help
	Donate


		
	



	

	
		
	

	
		
		

		
	




	
		Tools
	

	
		
			What links here
	Related changes
	Special pages
	Permanent link
	Page information
	Cite this page
	Get shortened URL
	Download QR code


		
	




	
		Print/export
	

	
		
			Printable version
	Download EPUB
	Download MOBI
	Download PDF
	Other formats


		
	



	

	
		In other languages
	

	
		
		

		

	










		 This page was last edited on 16 November 2023, at 17:18.
	Text is available under the Creative Commons Attribution-ShareAlike License; additional terms may apply.  By using this site, you agree to the Terms of Use and Privacy Policy.




		Privacy policy
	About Wikisource
	Disclaimers
	Code of Conduct
	Developers
	Statistics
	Cookie statement
	Mobile view



		[image: Wikimedia Foundation]
	[image: Powered by MediaWiki]






